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consul t i ng 

Enterprise Cloud Architect Consultants specialising in Microsoft 
365 and cloud solutions. The have strong track record of 
designing and implementing scalable, secure, and efficient cloud 
environments for small and large organisations. Key 
responsibilities include leading strategic initiatives for Microsoft 
365, developing customised roadmaps for cloud adoption, and 
implementing governance frameworks to ensure data 
protection and compliance. 

Our consultants also have expertise in Azure services, including 
identity and access management, cloud migration, and security. 
Additionally, they possess skills in designing technical solutions 
on Google Cloud Platform (GCP), with a focus on data 
engineering, CI/CD flows, and advanced access controls. Their 
experience extends to managing infrastructure as code, data 
processing pipelines, and identity management in cloud 

environments. Overall, the consultant combines technical 

leadership with a deep understanding of cloud security, 

compliance, and architecture. 
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-  V i r t ua l i s a t i on  

o VMware 

o Hyper-V 

- Microsoft Servers 

o DC 

o DNS 

o Exchange  

o SQL 

- Linux Servers 

- Networking/ Firewalls 

- Cisco 

- Juniper 
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- Fortinet 
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PLATFORM INFRASTRUCTURE DELIVERY (PID) 

  Our expert team offers comprehensive infrastructure 
consultancy services to help businesses optimise their IT 
environment. With deep knowledge in HP, Cisco, VMware, and 
Hyper-V technologies, we tailor solutions that align with your 
unique requirements. Whether it's upgrading your existing 
infrastructure, designing new systems, or assessing current 
performance, we focus on scalability, efficiency, and cost-
effectiveness. Our approach ensures your IT infrastructure 
supports business growth while maintaining robust security and 
operational reliability. 

We specialise in end-to-end infrastructure implementation, 
leveraging industry-leading technologies from HP, Cisco, 
VMware, and Hyper-V. Our team manages the full lifecycle of 
your project, from initial planning to deployment and ongoing 
support. Whether you're implementing new servers, virtual 
environments, or network solutions, we ensure seamless 
integration with your existing systems. By deploying cutting-
edge technology and best practices, we deliver high-
performance infrastructure that enhances operational agility 
and maximizes return on investment. 
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These paragraphs highlight your business’s 

technical expertise and focus on tailored, high-

quality solutions using top-tier technologies.

Platform technology solution providers 
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